Sign Bid Request for Leavenworth County
10.23.2025 End of year Sign Bid Tabualtion

Custom Products Jackson, Welborn Sales Barco Municipal National Sign Co Lightle Enterprises Vulcan Signs Technology Internation Lake
Ms Salina, KS Ottawa, KS Ottawa, KS Road Runner Safety Jackson, MO Frankfort, OH Foley, AL Mary, FL
Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total
High Intensity Prismatic reflective Faces P/S Our Bid Qty
R1-1 30" Stop White/Red 20 S 1271 |$ 25420 S 27.51 (S 550.20 (S 15.85 (S 317.00 [S 16.00 |S 320.00 | $ 30.39 |$ 607.80 [S 15.74 |S 314.80 [S 11.88 (S 237.60 S 100.00 |S 2,000.00
OM-3L 12" x 36" Black/Yellow 40 S 6.46 S 258.40 S 14.75|S 590.00 | S 7.95 |S 318.00 | S 7.90 | S 316.00 |$ 16.30 | $ 652.00 |S 7.56 |$ 302.40 |S 5.70 |$ 228.00 |S 85.00 |$ 3,400.00
OM-3R 12" x 36" Black/Yellow 40 S 6.46 [S 25840 |S 14.75|S 590.00 | S 7.95 |S 318.00 |S 7.90 (S 316.00 | S 16.30 | S 652.00 | S 7.56 [S 302.40 |S 5.70 | S 228.00 |S 85.00 |S$ 3,400.00
W3 Stop Ahead Symbol 30" x 30" black/yellow/red 10 S 2039 (S 203.90 (S 25.62 (S 256.20 [S 25.20 |S 252.00 (S 24.00 |S 240.00 | $ 28.31 (S 283.10 (S 18.61 (S 186.10 (S 13.81 (S 138.10 (S 170.00 |S$ 1,700.00
OM4-3 18" x 18" Red 6 S 8.80 |$ 52.80 (S 12.28 |$ 73.68 S 10.70 |$ 64.20 (S 9.20 |$ 55.20 | S 13.57 |$ 81.42 |S 5.67 |$ 34.02 |S 9.29 |$ 55.74 S 65.00 |$ 390.00
R2-1 Speed Limit 24" x 30" Black/White 20 S 10.70 |$ 214.00 [S 18.61 (S 372.20 S 13.95 (S 279.00 [S 13.90 |S 278.00 | S 20.57 |$ 411.40 |S 12.60 (S 252.00 | S 9.50 |$ 190.00 (S 120.00 |S 2,400.00
No Numbers on sign face
M1-6 Route Marker blue/yellow 24" 10 S 2242|S 22420 S 18.09 |S 180.90 |$ 17.00 |S 170.00 |S 16.10 |S 161.00 | $ 19.99 |$ 199.90 (S 10.08 |$ 100.80 (S 16.52 |$ 165.20 (S 55.00 |$ 550.00
W8-3 Pavement Ends 30" x 30" black/yellow 18 S 13.08 |$ 235.44 S 25.62 |$ 461.16 |S 17.00 |$ 306.00 |S 16.30 (S 293.40 | S 28.31 (S 509.58 |S 15.74 |S 283.32 |S 11.88 (S 213.84 |S 135.00 S 2,430.00
R12-1 Weight Limit 24" x 30" black/white 25 S 11.75|$ 293.75 S 18.38 (S 459.50 (S 15.10 (S 377.50 S 14.10 (S 352.50 | $ 20.31 (S 507.75 |S 12.60 |S 315.00 | S 9.50 |$ 237.50 S 120.00 |S 3,000.00
Metal 0.08 Aluminum
24"x30" 2 holes 20 S 2051 (S 410.20 [$ 28.12 (S 562.40 [S 21.10 |S 422.00 |S 19.70 |S 394.00 | $ 28.08 |$ 561.60 [S 28.69 |S 573.80 (S 19.36 |S 387.20 (S 68.00 |S 1,360.00
12"x36" 2 holes 40 S 1237 |$ 49480 |S 16.87 |$ 674.80 [S 14.05 |$ 562.00 |S 13.50 (S 540.00 | S 15.84 |$ 633.60 |S 22.74 (S 909.60 |S 12.09 |$ 483.60 |S 63.00 (S 2,520.00
30" x 30" 4 holes punched for diamond and square 20 S 2734 |S$ 546.80 [S 35.15 (S 703.00 (S 25.35 (S 507.00 [S 24.70 (S 494.00 | $ 35.10 |$ 702.00 [S 47.38|S 947.60 S 24.20 |S 484.00 |S 80.00 [S 1,600.00
30" stop 2 holes 20 S 2441 |S 488.20 [S 60.49 [S 1,209.80 |S 25.35|S 507.00 [S 24.70 |S 494.00 | $ 64.57 | S 1,291.40 [S 47.38 |S 947.60 S 23.04 |S 460.80 |S 74.00 (S 1,480.00
24" Route Marker M1-6 2 holes 10 S 20.80|$ 208.00 S 22.49 (S 22490 (S 32.05 (S 320.50 |S 32.10 (S 321.00 |S 2246 (S 22460 |S 30.32 (S 303.20 |S 14.40 (S 144.00 (S 50.00 |$ 500.00
6" x 12" 2 holes 30 S 2.88 (S 86.40 | S 2.81 (S 84.30 |S 245 |S 73.50 | S 2.00 |S 60.00 | $ 2.80 (S 84.00 | S 3.79 (S 113.70 |S 3.53 (S 105.90 (S 10.00 | S 300.00
9" x 24" no holes 30 S 6.41 |$ 192.30 | S 8.44 |$ 253.20 | S 6.95 |$ 208.50 | S 6.50 |$ 195.00 | $ 8.42 (S 252.60 |S 11.37 (S 341.10 |S 6.88 |$ 206.40 |S 30.00 |$ 900.00
9" x 30" no holes 30 S 8.02 |S 240.60 S 10.54 |S 316.20 | S 8.95 | S 268.50 [ S 8.80 |S 264.00 | S 10.53 |$ 31590 S 15.16 |S 454.80 | S 8.59 | S 257.70 [S 40.00 |S 1,200.00
R11-4 Road Closed to thru traffic black/white 60" x 30" 8 S 83.85|($ 670.80 S 113.19 |S$ 905.52 (S 74.00 |S 592.00 [S 66.00 |S 528.00 | $ 104.60 | S 836.80 [S 94.75 (S 758.00 [S 79.25 (S 634.00 (S 300.00 |S 2,400.00
BID 4 ROLLS BID 4 ROLLS BID 12 ROLLS

12"x50 yds Green Electrocut 2 roll S 169.50 |$ 339.00 | NO BID NO BID S 235.00 |$ 940.00 |$ 210.00 |S 840.00 | $ 338.58 | $ 4,062.96 |$S 187.50 |S 375.00 S 175.50 |$ 351.00 |S 420.00 |S 840.00
12"x50 yds Black Electrocut 2 roll S 169.50 |$ 339.00 | NO BID NO BID S 235.00 |$ 940.00 |S 210.00 |$ 840.00 |$ 338.58 |$ 4,062.96 |S 240.00 (S 480.00 |$ 175.50 |$ 351.00 |S 420.00 |$ 840.00
Replacement Pannels Barricade Orange/White
8ft x1"x8" Plastic High Intensity Double Face 18 S 66.12|$ 1,190.16 |S 46.47 |S 836.46 |S 35.95 (S 647.10 [S 37.00 |$ 666.00 | S 47.12 |S 848.16 |S 86.74|S 1,561.32 (S 5893 |S 1,060.74 |S 95.00 S 1,710.00
Triangular markers Guardrail reflectors double sided 400 S 5.11|$ 2,044.00 | S 4.85|S 1,940.00 |S 5.11 |S 2,044.00 |S 498 |S 1,992.00 (S 6.04 [S 2,416.00 |S 2.69 |S 1,076.00 |S 1.08 |S 432.00 | S 7.00 |$ 2,800.00
high intensity white reflectgor bolt-on, butter fly plastic
Orange 36" Double reflective collars 4" and 6" 10lb base 24 S 2884 |$ 692.16 [S 29.80 |$ 715.20 [S 28.97 |$ 695.28 [S 32.00 (S 768.00 | S 39.97 [ S 959.28 |S 22.71 (S 545.04 |S 37.63 |$ 903.12 |$ 70.00 [S 1,680.00
Wide Body Cone
C-42 Channelizer with 4 each x 4" Hi sheeting and Cb-30lb base 20 S 6361|$ 1,272.20|$ 50.82 |S 1,016.40 (S 54.41 (S 1,088.20|S 53.00|S 1,060.00 |S 53.07 | S 1,061.40 |S 21.88 (S 437.60 |S 65.24 (S 1,304.80 |S 95.00|S 1,900.00
Rubber stacker Stand Dsb100 10 S 140.00 |$ 1,400.00 |$ 107.20 |S 1,072.00 |S 99.00 |$ 990.00 |S 90.00 (S 900.00 |$ 117.73 |$ 1,177.30 |$ 147.00 |S 1,470.00 |$ 153.96 S 1,539.60 [S 164.00 |S 1,640.00
Galvanized round post 12' 2 3/8" 48 S 3452|$ 1,656.96 |S 49.82|S 2,391.36 (S 37.50 (S 1,800.00 |S 30.00|S 1,440.00 |S 119.96 |$ 5,758.08 |[S 3862 |S 1,853.76 |S 40.30 (S 1,934.40 |S 130.00 |S 6,240.00
Street Sign Brackets
90 deg Cross Piece 808F-90 Flat 300 S 5.50 1,650.00 | $ 5.32 1,596.00 | S 6.90 |S 2,070.00 | S 6.00 |S 1,800.00 6.03 1,809.00 |$ 4.86 1,458.00 |$ 8.40 2,520.00 (S 50.00 |$ 15,000.00
2-3/8" 0.D. Round Post Cap 808FRC Flat 200 S 5.50 1,100.00 | $ 5.96 1,192.00 | S 6.90 |S 1,380.00 |S 6.00 |S 1,200.00 6.66 1,332.00 |S 5.18 1,036.00 |S 8.43 1,686.00 |S 6.00 |S 1,200.00
12"x50 yds white high intensity #3930 prizmatic 4 rolls S 195.00 |$ 780.00 [S 274.79 |$ 1,099.16 |$ 220.00 |S 880.00 |S 199.00 (S 796.00 | S 423.85 |$ 1,695.40 |$ 199.50 |S 798.00 |S 220.50 (S 882.00 |$ 390.00 [S 1,560.00




TRPM Flexible chip and seal markers
TRPM 4" W-2 WZ Standard

TRPM Flexible chip and seal markers
TRPM 4" Y-2 WZ Standard

Green U Channel Post 7' 1.12 |b/ft
3/8 x 1- 12" outside dia. Nylon washer

Green U Channel Post 12' 2.00 Ib/ft

500 0.95 [$ 475.00 0.60 300.00 0.68 |$ 340.00 0.70 | S 350.00 0.72 360.00 0.73 |$ 365.00 1.25 |$ 625.00 6.00 3,000.00
500 0.95 |$ 475.00 0.60 300.00 0.68 | S 340.00 0.70 S 350.00 0.72 360.00 0.73 | $ 365.00 1.25 |S 625.00 6.00 3,000.00
50 19.08 | S 954.00 13.95 697.50 13.39 |S 669.50 12.90 | S 645.00 12.33 616.50 8.28 | S 414.00 11.30 |S 565.00 48.00 2,400.00
600 0.42 |S 252.00 0.33 198.00 0.79 |S 474.00 0.59 |$ 354.00 0.33 198.00 0.22 |$ 132.00 0.58 | $ 348.00 2.00 1,200.00
50 25.24 |S  1,262.00 37.62 1,881.00 28.97 |S 1,448.50 28.00 |S 1,400.00 34.94 1,747.00 29.10 |$ 1,455.00 32.16 |S 1,608.00 96.00 4,800.00
TOTAL OF
ALL PAGES $ 21,214.67 23,703.04 S 22,609.28 $ 21,023.10 37,271.49 $ 21,261.96 $ 21,593.24 81,340.00
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